
Bid Summary 
Harley O. Staggers Building 

Asbestos Abatement Project 
Monongalia County Commission 

Morgantown, West Virginia 

 
 

Contractor Bid Item 1 Cost Bid Item 2 Cost Bid Item 2A Cost Bid Item 3 Cost 
Total Cost – 120 Day 

Completion 
(Bid Items 1, 2, and 3) 

Total Cost – 180 Day 
Completion 

(Bid Items 1, 2A, and 3) 

Required Documentation 
Submitted With Bid 

LVI Environmental Services $95,000.00 $962,500.00 $962,500.00 $236,500.00 $1,294,000.00 $1,294,000.00 Yes 

Dore & Associates $132,600.00 $1,115,600.00 $1,085,600.00 $18,700.00 $1,266,900.00 $1,236,900.00 Yes 

Canfield Development, Inc. $145,000.00 $1,752,777.00 $1,615,000.00 $180,000.00 $2,077,777.00 $1,940,000.00 Yes 

Abmech, Inc. $120,990.00 $1,385,200.00 $1,313,400.00 $310,000.00 $1,816,190.00 $1,744,390.00 Yes 

Reclaim Company, LLC $18,500.00 $1,043,000.00 $999,999.00 $0.01 $1,061,500.01 $1,018,499.01 Yes 

Astar Abatement, Inc. NO BID SUBMITTED 

Firth Environmental, LLC NO BID SUBMITTED 

American Contracting NO BID SUBMITTED 

SafeCo NO BID SUBMITTED 

Bristol Environmental NO BID SUBMITTED 

 
Note: The apparent low bidder for the project is shown in red.  The Monongalia County Commission will perform a more thorough review of the submitted bids and determine whether they elect to have the project accomplished in 

120 days or 180 days.  Upon determination of the time period desired, the low bidder will be contacted to verify their bid and award the contract. 


